
 
 

Devotional – Week 3, Day 3 
 
So you have not received a spirit that makes you fearful slaves. Instead, you received 
God’s Spirit when he adopted you as his own children. Now we call him, “Abba, 
Father.” For his Spirit joins with our spirit to affirm that we are God’s children. And 
since we are his children, we are his heirs. In fact, together with Christ we are heirs of 
God’s glory. But if we are to share his glory, we must also share his suffering. 

Yet what we suffer now is nothing compared to the glory he will reveal to us 
later. For all creation is waiting eagerly for that future day when God will reveal who his 
children really are. Against its will, all creation was subjected to God’s curse. But with 
eager hope, the creation looks forward to the day when it will join God’s children in 
glorious freedom from death and decay. For we know that all creation has been 
groaning as in the pains of childbirth right up to the present time. And we believers also 
groan, even though we have the Holy Spirit within us as a foretaste of future glory, for 
we long for our bodies to be released from sin and suffering. We, too, wait with eager 
hope for the day when God will give us our full rights as his adopted children, including 
the new bodies he has promised us. We were given this hope when we were saved. (If 
we already have something, we don’t need to hope for it. But if we look forward to 
something we don’t yet have, we must wait patiently and confidently.) 
Romans 8:15-25 

 
At The Ridge, our mission is to help people find and follow Jesus. As you read the next 
portion of this devotional, consider the FIND comments if you if you are exploring faith 
or helping others explore their faith. Use the FOLLOW section to help you take steps if 
you are currently following Jesus. 

 
FIND: 
Is a part of you groaning for more than this life has to offer?   
 
FOLLOW: 
You are not popular being a Christian in society today. Jesus promised us we would 
have trials. Who are you bringing alongside you to help you through life’s struggles? 


